
 DACW17-00-B-0032  
Riprap, Bedding Stone

Name of Offeror Line Item 0001 Line Item 0002 Line Item 0003 Line Item 0004 Line Item 0005 Line Item 0006
U/P 7,500 TN U/P 5,000 TN U/P 2,500 TN U/P 1,5000 TN U/P 2,500 TN U/P 12,500 TN TOTAL

Abbott's Backhoe No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid      No Bid No Bid
Ridgdill & Son, Inc 12.00$   90,000.00$      12.50$   62,500.00$      13.50$   33,750.00$      16.50$   247,500.00$    17.50$   43,750.00$      17.50$   218,750.00$    $696,250.00
Statewide Materials 21.50$   161,250.00$    21.50$   107,500.00$    19.50$   48,750.00$      21.50$   322,500.00$    19.50$   48,750.00$      21.50$   268,750.00$    $957,500.00
D' Elegance 20.40$   153,000.00$    19.95$   99,750.00$      25.40$   63,500.00$      20.40$   306,000.00$    25.65$   64,125.00$      21.00$   262,500.00$    $948,875.00
Artem, Inc 20.29$   152,175.00$    19.73$   98,650.00$      24.93$   62,325.00$      20.17$   302,550.00$    24.49$   61,225.00$      20.62$   257,750.00$    $934,675.00
Mediterranean 25.60$   192,000.00$    25.24$   126,200.00$    24.70$   61,750.00$      25.64$   378,600.00$    24.70$   61,750.00$      25.60$   320,000.00$    $1,140,000.00
Chesapeake 39.25$   294,375.00$    39.25$   196,250.00$    36.00$   90,000.00$      36.25$   543,750.00$    33.00$   82,500.00$      36.25$   453,125.00$    $1,660,000.00


